
TOWN OF GRANTSBURG 

TOWN MEETING MINUTES 

Oct 12, 2020 

 

Chairman Paden Called the meeting to order at 5:30pm. Supervisor Shultz was absent. In 
attendance were Chairman Paden, Supervisor Curtin, Clerk/Treasurer Toni Carter, Lee 
Moyer, Marian Moyer, Jeremy Burton, and Mike Hoefs. 

Pledge of allegiance was recited. 

Notice posted in accordance with Wisconsin statute 19.84 open meeting law. 

Approve agenda order. 

Minutes from Sept 14, 2020 meeting read by Clerk/Treasurer Toni Carter; motion by 
Supervisor Curtin to approve minutes; seconded by Chairman Paden: passed unanimously. 
 
No citizen input 
 
The Burnett County commissioner Mike Hoefs gave a report on his position regarding why 
he believes there is a considerable benefit to utilizing the county for roadwork, 
maintenance and snow removal.  Siting equal financial cost but reducing liability factors to 
the town as a benefit to utilizing the County.  Also discussed the importance of maintenance 
He's keeping an eye on the GSB88 that was applied to Hickerson Rd to see how much it 
extends the the roads life. 
 

Jeremy Burton; Burnett County Hwy Dept. Operations Manager also gave a summary in 
support of the BC commissioners statement regarding private versus county road 
maintenance costs and benefits. 
 
Presentation of supplemental invoice request for the purchase of Covid related electronics 
including the New Voting machines. Supervisor Curtin made the motion to approve; 
Chairman Paden 2nd, passed unanimously. 
 

Only correspondence reported is a building permit for a garage. 
 
Road updates were discussed along with the Burnett County Commissioners presentation. 
 
A discussion took place between Chairman Paden, Commissioner Hoefs, Jeremy Burton and 
Lee Moyer regarding Black top that was picked up Aug 11, 2020 and not yet applied to the 
town roads.  
 
Fire report is on file at Town Hall, Supervisor Shultz was not present to convey report.  



 
Chairman's report was regarding the town GTA is $136,104. 
 
The Budget Hearing was set for November 9th at 5:30; the special meeting for the Levy will 
follow and include request for salary increase for elected officials, the regular monthly 
meeting will follow the special meeting.  Supervisor Curtin motioned to approve, Chairman 
Paden 2nd, passed unanimously. 
 
 
 The treasurer's presented the financial report, Supervisor Curtin made the motion to 
approve the report, Chairman Paden 2nd, passed unanimously. 
 
Presentation of  invoices for payment, Supervisor Curtin motioned to approve invoices, 
Chairman Paden 2nd, passed unanimously, 
 
Motion to Adjourn made by Supervisor Curtin, 2nd by Chairman Paden, Passed unanimously 
at 6:35. 
 
Respectfully submitted by Toni Carter; Clerk/Treasurer 
 
 
 
 


